
 

Scientific Games Off To The Races With Its New Release Rainbow 
Riches™ Race Day™ 

 
Latest big game launch brings sports-themed title to the Rainbow Riches franchise 

 
LAS VEGAS – February 24 2021 – Scientific Games Corporation (NASDAQ: 
SGMS)  (“Scientific Games” or the “Company”) has unveiled its new sports-themed slot, 
Rainbow Riches Race Day, the latest creation utilizing the hugely popular gaming franchise.  
 
Gamesys, who have a long-time association with the Rainbow Riches brand on their UK 
sites – having licensed it from the Company for their incredibly successful Rainbow Riches 
Casino site (www.rainbowrichescasino.com) – launched Rainbow Riches Race Day 
exclusively to their UK players last week. 
 
The latest, feature-rich slot from the Company’s iconic brand is inspired by the classic horse 
racing arcade machines. The familiar race format sits above the reels, with players required 
to collect horses to advance along the racetrack and the first to cross the winning post 
awards the associated prize. 
 
The latest big game launch from Scientific Games retains all the popular characteristics 
associated with the gaming franchise. The 6x4 slot features numerous ways of winning and 
includes cascading wins, a popular mechanic in today’s online casino marketplace. Within 
the bonus round, players have the ability to choose how the free spins are played out, with 
responsible gaming features prevalent. 
 
Rainbow Riches Race Day has been launched ahead of key UK horse racing meetings 
Cheltenham Festival and the Grand National. Several tier one sportsbook customers of 
Scientific Games have already committed to marketing campaigns that incorporate the latest 
instalment from the Company’s Rainbow Riches series. 
 
Simon Mizzi, Marketing Director at Gamesys said: “We’re pleased to be working closely with 
Scientific Games again to extend our range of Rainbow Riches titles with this exclusive deal. 
Rainbow Riches Race Day is an exciting new game which showcases our quest to innovate 
with new, topical content that will resonate with our players and help us to reach new 
audiences.” 
 
Rob Procter, Content Specialist Director, Digital at Scientific Games said, “Rainbow Riches 
Race Day marks another stellar addition to our portfolio this year and offers a unique 
gameplay that evolves the Rainbow Riches franchise to a new level. Those familiar with 
horse racing arcade machines will appreciate the way in which we’ve incorporated the 
format into the game, while for Rainbow Riches fans there’s a new concept to experience 
that includes all the iconic characteristics they love. We believe Rainbow Riches Race Day 
will appeal to a wide audience and prove to be a huge hit with players.”    
 
To download the assets and play a demo version, please visit: 
https://www.sgdigital.com/opengaming/game-rainbow-riches-race-day.html 
 

http://www.scientificgames.com/
http://www.rainbowrichescasino.com/
https://www.sgdigital.com/opengaming/game-rainbow-riches-race-day.html
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About Scientific Games 
Scientific Games Corporation (NASDAQ: SGMS) is a world leader in entertainment offering 
dynamic games, systems and services for casino, lottery, social gaming, online gaming and 
sports betting. Scientific Games offers the gaming industry's broadest and most integrated 
portfolio of game content, advanced systems, cutting-edge platforms and professional 
services. Committed to responsible gaming, Scientific Games delivers what customers and 
players value most: trusted security, engaging entertainment content, operating efficiencies 
and innovative technology. For more information, please visit scientificgames.com. 
 

Media Inquiries: 

Media@scientificgames.com  
 
Forward-Looking Statements 
In this press release, Scientific Games makes "forward-looking statements" within the 
meaning of the U.S. Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. Forward-looking 
statements can be identified by words such as "will," "may," and "should." These statements 
are based upon management's current expectations, assumptions and estimates and are 
not guarantees of timing, future results or performance. Therefore, you should not rely on 
any of these forward-looking statements as predictions of future events. Actual results may 
differ materially from those contemplated in these statements due to a variety of risks, 
uncertainties and other factors, including those factors described in our filings with the 
Securities and Exchange Commission (the “SEC”), including Scientific Games’ current 
reports on Form 8-K, quarterly reports on Form 10-Q and its latest annual report on Form 
10-K filed with the SEC on February 18, 2020 (including under the headings "Forward-
Looking Statements" and "Risk Factors"). Forward-looking statements speak only as of the 
date they are made and, except for Scientific Games' ongoing obligations under the U.S. 
federal securities laws, Scientific Games undertakes no obligation to publicly update any 
forward-looking statements whether as a result of new information, future events or 
otherwise.  
 

About Gamesys Group plc 

Gamesys Group plc is the parent company of an online gaming group that provides 

entertainment to a global consumer base. Through its subsidiaries, Gamesys Group plc 

currently offers bingo and casino games to its customers using brands which include 

Jackpotjoy (www.jackpotjoy.com), Virgin Games (www.virgingames.com), Botemania 

(www.botemania.es), Vera&John (www.verajohn.com), Heart Bingo (www.heartbingo.co.uk), 

Monopoly Casino (www.monopolycasino.com), and Rainbow Riches Casino 

(www.rainbowrichescasino.com).  

As part of its ongoing commitment to safer gambling, Gamesys provides players with easy-

to-use services and tools to help them play responsibly – including Session Reminders, 

Deposit Limits and Cool Offs.  

 

Gamesys won Operator of the Year at the EGR Operator Awards 2020, as well as Bingo 

Operator of the Year and Employer of the Year. 

For more information about Gamesys Group plc, please visit www.gamesysgroup.com. 
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