
 

 

Equinox™ Range Highlights SG Gaming’s Breadth Across Sectors 

 

LONDON, March 29, 2018 – Scientific Games Corporation’s (NASDAQ: SGMS) 

("Scientific Games" or the “Company") SG Gaming demonstrated its ongoing 

dedication to innovation as the business displayed its largest ever new product 

portfolio at the recent ICE Totally Gaming event in London. The event provided 

the perfect platform to introduce the industry to the breadth and depth of the new 

Equinox range for the first time, highlighting how the broad range of terminal 

options have been developed to meet the requirements of its customers across 

the LBO, arcade, bingo and casino sectors. 

 

The real showstopper was the Equinox MPS, which was unveiled to customers at 

the show to an overwhelmingly positive response, securing a significant deal 

within hours of the show opening. Developed specifically for the arcade and bingo 

sector, the MPS emphasizes SG Gaming’s position as leaders and innovators within 

community gaming. With its striking 55-inch curve feature screen and stunning 

4K graphics, its stand-out appearance on the gaming floor also ensured continued 

success throughout the next two days.  

 

Also leading the line-up of new hardware were the Equinox 2.4 and 2.7 terminals, 

which incorporate a number of new design features developed following extensive 

research into player and customer requirements. 

 

In particular, the new ‘privacy mode’ tool, a unique industry innovation, 

demonstrated to SG Gaming customers and to the industry that this range of new 

terminals had been developed to offer a differentiated product, which many 

customers felt to have successfully addressed a growing need for increased 

privacy options. In addition, customers embraced the dynamic modular design of 



the terminal, which offers increased flexibility and can help to reduce costs over 

the product’s life-cycle. 

 

The event also highlighted the progression of SG Gaming’s UK casino offering 

through the Riviera® terminal and much anticipated addition of the Jackpot Party® 

Mystery Progressive - a significant step forward for SG Gaming’s casino offering, 

which was launched in 2017. 

Simon Johnson, Group Commercial Director at SG Gaming, said: “It’s incredibly 

exciting to have been able to use the ICE Totally Gaming event as a platform to 

showcase to the industry the effort that we have gone to as a business to create 

a suite of innovative new products, and to demonstrate developments such as our 

new casino progressive.  

“Our team has worked extremely hard for the past year to introduce this new 

product range, so receiving such positive feedback from our customers is very 

encouraging, and really is testament to all the hard work our teams have put in.  

We’re thrilled to have presented both our new content and our omni-channel 

focused games, such as The Legend of Bigfoot® and Rainbow Riches Fortune 

Favours®, alongside our Digital division. This is integral to our customer strategy 

and continues to be a key focus of what we deliver.  

“I’m particularly looking forward to providing our casino customers with the new 

Jackpot Party Progressive, many of whom will start to see the product introduced 

from March onwards this year. We look forward to continuing the success of ICE 

throughout this year via our new product and content initiatives, as well as our 

continued efforts to drive innovation which we believe will enhance performance 

for our customers.” 

All ® notices signify marks registered in the United Kingdom.  © 2018 Scientific 

Games Corporation.  All Rights Reserved. 

About Scientific Games  

Scientific Games Corporation (NASDAQ: SGMS) is a world leader in gaming 
entertainment offering the industry's broadest and most integrated portfolio of game 
content, advanced systems, cutting-edge platforms and professional services. The 
company is #1 in technology-based gaming systems, digital real-money gaming and 
sports betting platforms, casino table games and utility products and lottery instant 
games, and a leading provider of games, systems and services for casino, lottery and 



social gaming. Committed to responsible gaming, Scientific Games delivers what 
customers and players value most: trusted security, engaging entertainment content, 
operating efficiencies and innovative technology. For more information, please visit 
www.scientificgames.com.  
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Forward-Looking Statements 

In this press release, Scientific Games makes "forward-looking statements" within the 
meaning of the U.S. Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. Forward-looking 
statements can be identified by words such as "will," "may," and "should." These 
statements are based upon management's current expectations, assumptions and 
estimates and are not guarantees of timing, future results or performance. Therefore, 
you should not rely on any of these forward-looking statements as predictions of future 
events. Actual results may differ materially from those contemplated in these statements 
due to a variety of risks and uncertainties and other factors, including those factors 
described in our filings with the SEC, including the Company's current reports on Form 
8-K, quarterly reports on Form 10-Q and its latest annual report on Form 10-K filed with 
the SEC on March 1, 2018 (including under the headings "Forward Looking Statements" 
and "Risk Factors"). Forward-looking statements speak only as of the date they are 
made and, except for Scientific Games' ongoing obligations under the U.S. federal 
securities laws, Scientific Games undertakes no obligation to publicly update any 
forward-looking statements whether as a result of new information, future events or 
otherwise. 


